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NEW DIAPATH 
LAB TALKS HUB  
 
It is a repository that includes a full range of scientific articles, 
webinars, training resources, blogs, podcasts and interviews with 
Opinion Leaders and experts in the field of Anatomic Pathology, 
Histology and Cytology. 
 
The main purpose is to create a community of pathologists and 
laboratory professionals where they can share and exchange smart 
ideas, best practices and scenarios with other professionals and keep 
updated with the latest scientific developments in Anatomic Pathology.  
 
This new platform has five sections to discover. In addition to the 
company presentation section that links directly to the website, there is 
also a section dedicated to scientific articles, where you can find a 
collection of recent studies that include Diapath solutions and more. 
You can also select the year, month and Diapath product on which you 
want to read the latest news. 
 
Another section deals with webinars, where you can find the calendar of 
upcoming webinars and register to preview the content. It is also 
possible to review the content published in the on-demand training 
resources section, where a simple login allows you to watch past 
webinars on-demand as many times as you like.  
 
The fourth section is dedicated to blogs where you can find publications 
organised in categories and you can select the topic you are interested 
in and interact with other members of the Diapath Lab Talks 
community. Twice a month, new articles will be published in the fields of 
Histology, Anatomic Pathology and Diagnostics. To access, simply enter 
your credentials. The laboratory routine needs to share experiences and 
bright ideas.  
 
The last section is the podcast section where you can listen to all 
Diapath podcasts organised in categories. Simply log in with your 
credentials and enjoy. These consist of interviews with authors, opinion 
leaders and experts on the latest developments in science, technology 
and pathology. 
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Finally, it is important to note that Diapath is accredited by NSH as a 
training provider and the participation in each webinar entitles you to 1 
CEU. 
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